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THE HEADLINES :- 

 Prime Minister Narendra Modi to host 3rd Voice of Global South 
Summit tomorrow.                                                 

 Nagaland Governor La Ganesan holds review meeting with State 
Level Bankers' Committee officials. 

 Chief Minister Neiphiu Rio recalls historic statement of former 
Prime Minister Atal Bihari Vajpayee recognizing the unique history 
and culture of the Nagas. 

 Health Ministry directs heads of institutions to file FIRS within six 
hours in cases of violence against doctors. 

<><><><><><><> 

India will host the 3rd Voice of Global South Summit tomorrow in a 
virtual format. The inaugural session will be at the Head of State and 
Government level and will be hosted by Prime Minister Narendra Modi. 
The theme of the Summit is "An Empowered Global South for a 
Sustainable Future." Briefing reporters in New Delhi, External Affairs 
Ministry Spokesperson Randhir Jaiswal said that all Global South 
countries have been invited to attend the summit. The Summit will serve 
as a platform to expand discussions held in previous summits on a 
range of complex challenges that continue to affect the world, such as 
conflicts, food and energy security crises, and climate change. At the 
Summit, the countries of the Global South will continue deliberations on 
challenges, priorities, and solutions for the Global South, particularly in 
the developmental domain.                         

 <><><><><><><> 

 Nagaland Governor La Ganesan today held a review meeting with the 
State Level Bankers' Committee, SLBC officials today. PRO, Raj Bhavan 
in press release said that during the meeting, the Governor discussed 
banking-related matters of the state with SLBC Committee, SLBC 
Nagaland officials, Convenor of SLBC, Nagaland, Hubert A S 
Wungshim, and Coordinator of SLBC, Nagaland, H. Lalhlimpuia.  



  <><><><><><><> 

Nagaland Chief Mnister Neiphiu Rio today recalled the historic statement 
of former Prime Minister Atal Bihari Vajpayee during his visit to 
Nagaland in 2003 recognizing the unique history and culture of the 
Nagas. It was a defining moment in the relationship between the Nagas 
and rest of India, Rio said in a social media post. Earlier today,  Chief 
Minister Rio attended a prayer meeting in Delhi on the 6th death 
anniversary of Former Prime Minister Atal Bihari Vajpayee.   

  <><><><><><><> 

 Union Health Ministry has directed the Head of Institution will be 
responsible for filing an Institutional FIR within a maximum of six hours 
in case of violence against Doctors. Director General of Health Services 
Atul Goel has written a letter to the head of the central government 
hospitals and medical colleges in this regard. The direction came in the 
wake of the recent incident of murder of a doctor in Kolkata and protest 
by the resident doctors over the issue. In his letter he said that recently it 
has been observed that violence has become common against doctors 
and other healthcare staff in Government Hospitals. A number of Health 
workers suffer physical violence during the course of their duty. Many 
are threatened or exposed to verbal aggression. Most of this violence is 
done by either patient or patient’s attendants.                          

  <><><><><><><> 

Nagaland Chief Minister Neiphiu Rio has said that the Chief Minister's 
Universal Life Insurance Scheme, CMULIS provides financial security for 
eligible citizens of the State. Rio in a social media post said that the 
CMULIS provides coverage of life and accidental insurance and will 
ensure that families are protected from unforeseen hardships. The Chief 
Minister said the scheme is a step towards a more secure future.   

 <><><><><><><> 

The Indian Space Research Organisation today launched the Earth 
Observation Satellite (EOS-08) and also SR-O demo sat passenger 
satellite successfully. This is the 3rd development flight of SSLV and it 
has proved that India is capable of sending micro mini and nano 
satellites. All the three stages of the launch vehicle were successful and 
efficiently executed. Both the satellites have been injected into a 475 km 
circular orbit and the solar panels have been deployed. They are being 
tracked by the different ground stations of ISRO.         



 <><><><><><><>  

Tetso Mountaineering Club, Chumoukedima yesterday successfully 
completed an expedition to Mt. Japfu, scaling the formidable peak in 
celebration of India’s Independence Day. The expedition, named 
"Operation Tiranga: Hum Saath-Saath Hain," undertaken with support 
from the 13 Assam Rifles, Kohima which provided essential supplies, 
including rations, ropes, and other critical equipment. President of Tetso 
Mountaineering Club, Longtsubemo Yanthan led the along with 
seasoned mountaineers led the team. Founder and Director General of 
Tetso Mountaineering Club, Dr. Aniruddha Babar, said that the team's 
accomplishment was  remarkable, and the entire nation shares in this 
pride.                             

 <><><><><><><> 

Kohima Press Club, KPC members visited the District TB Hospital 
Khuzama yesterday of part of the 78th Indian Independence Day Home 
and Institution Visitation. During the visit, KPC members interacted 
briefly with the patients and handed over several essential items. KPC 
General Secretary Vishü Rita Krocha remarked that it is a privilege for 
the KPC to participate in a humanitarian cause on the occasion of 
Independence Day. Senior Journalist and KPC Member, H Chishi 
encouraged the patients by saying that TB was earlier viewed as a much 
dreaded disease but with advancement in medicine, this mindset has 
changed over the course of time. Medical Officer Dr. Kekhrievor Suohu 
also gave a brief highlight of the institution. 

  <><><><><><><> 

Chief Adviser of the interim government of Bangladesh, Muhammad 
Yunus, has assured the protection, safety, and security of Hindus and all 
minorities in his country. Prime Minister Narendra Modi today received a 
telephone call from Professor Muhammad Yunus. During the talks, they 
exchanged views on the prevailing situation. Modi reiterated India's 
support for a democratic, stable, peaceful, and progressive 
Bangladesh.                                                       

 <><><><><><><> 

Prime Minister Narendra Modi and his Israeli counterpart Benjamin 
Netanyahu today discussed the prevailing situation in West Asia. Modi 
received a telephone call from Benjamin Netanyahu. During the talks, 
Modi emphasized the need to de-escalate the situation. He reiterated 



India’s call for the immediate release of all hostages and the need for 
continued humanitarian assistance for the affected. Modi called for an 
early and peaceful resolution of the conflict through dialogue and 
diplomacy. The two leaders also discussed various aspects of bilateral 
cooperation and ways to further strengthen the India-Israel Strategic 
Partnership. Israeli Prime Minister Netanyahu also conveyed his warm 
wishes on the occasion of India’s 78th Independence Day 

   <><><><><><><> 

Chief of the Army Staff General, Upendra Dwivedi, today felicitated 
Indian Army sportspersons for their remarkable accomplishments at the 
Paris Olympics 2024. The Indian contingent clinched a total of six 
medals at the Paris Olympics, with Subedar Major Neeraj Chopra of the 
Indian Army winning the only silver medal in Javelin for India. Subedar 
Bommandevara Dhiraj also won the 4th Position in Archery Recurve. 
Defence sources said the exemplary performance of army 
sportspersons has etched itself as one of the most remarkable displays 
of the Indian Army at the Olympic Games.                                           

 <><><><><><><> 

The largest-ever contingent of 84 players from India will take part in the 
upcoming Paris Paralympic Games this year. The Paralympic Games 
will take place from the 28th of this month to the 8th of September 2024. 
Forty-seven athletes are taking part in the games for the first time. 
Addressing the send-off ceremony of the Indian contingent participating 
in the Paris Paralympic Games, Union Sports Minister Dr. Mansukh 
Mandaviya said that there are 50 players in this team who benefited 
from the Target Olympic Podium Scheme. He said the government has 
provided every facility, such as training and coaching, to the players 
under this scheme. Mandaviya said that many of the players have 
emerged from the Khelo India games.                

 <><><><><><><> 

  


